
tons cords per ton per cord per ton per cord per ton per cord

Aspen Pulp 15050 6689 $8.55 $19.24 $15.37 $34.58 $2.38 $5.36

Aspen Bolts 1695 753 $15.14 $34.07 $25.00 $56.25 $6.00 $13.50

Oak Pulp 9885 3595 $6.94 $19.10 $12.75 $35.06 $3.65 $10.04

Oak Bolts 3330 1211 $24.30 $66.82 $34.00 $93.50 $7.50 $20.63

Mixed Hardwood Pulp 9815 4267 $7.67 $17.65 $15.37 $35.35 $3.60 $8.28

Tamarack 0 0 #DIV/0! #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Basswood Pulp 80 41 $3.00 $5.79 $3.00 $5.79 $3.00 $5.79

Mixed Hardwood Bolts 185 80 $19.66 $45.22 $30.00 $69.00 $7.50 $17.25

Jack Pine Pulp 280 131 $2.38 $5.07 $2.38 $5.07 $2.38 $5.07

Red Pine Pulp 150 67 $8.00 $18.00 $8.00 $18.00 $8.00 $18.00

White Pine Pulp 1810 862 $7.12 $14.94 $10.00 $21.00 $2.38 $5.00

Red Pine Comingled 7850 3489 $44.51 $100.15 $49.35 $111.04 $31.00 $69.75

White Pine Comingled 1210 576 $27.27 $57.27 $31.00 $65.10 $5.50 $11.55

Red Oak Sawlog

White Oak Sawlog

Black Oak Sawlog

Red Maple Sawlog

Sugar Maple Sawlog

Mixed Hardwood Sawlog

Red Pine Sawlogs

White Pine Sawlogs

mbfmbf
806 $484.83 $550.00 $170.00

 AVERAGE SUCCESSFUL BIDS – As of May 6, 2021
Clark County Forest

Species/Type Volume Weighted Average High Low

mbfmbf

186.7 $501.23 $650.00 $200.00

53.1 $211.68 $225.00 $150.00

21 $248.10 $365.00 $160.00

0 #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00

95 $267.34 $400.00 $130.00

0 #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00

333 $127.13 $150.00 $120.00



TIMBER SALE BID RESULTS June 3, 2021

CLARK COUNTY FOREST

Qualified Non-Qualified

30-19 0 0 $7,316.00 -$                       

39-19 0 0 $7,496.10 -$                       

45-19 0 0 $5,915.00 -$                       

48-19 0 0 $3,488.80 -$                       

6-20 1 0 $7,326.00 8,320.00$               

15-20 0 0 $7,856.00 -$                       

17-20 1 0 $16,938.20 18,520.00$             

20-20 0 0 $10,395.60 -$                       

21-20 2 0 $41,038.30 44,050.00$             

23-20 1 0 $53,642.70 57,164.00$             

26-20 1 0 $25,311.00 28,192.50$             

27-20 1 0 $27,787.30 27,915.00$             

29-20 1 0 $18,760.30 20,800.00$             

35-20 0 0 $15,036.80 -$                       

40-20 1 0 $11,783.60 15,490.00$             

41-20 0 0 $2,663.20 -$                       

48-20 1 0 $22,569.60 22,698.40$             

49-20 0 0 $6,954.00 -$                       

1-21 4 0 $90,898.40 129,390.00$           

2-21 4 0 $26,119.20 28,254.00$             

3-21 9 1 $176,482.60 294,955.00$           

4-21 1 0 $6,668.60 6,820.00$               

5-21 1 0 $31,672.50 33,720.00$             

6-21 6 0 $33,922.80 49,204.00$             

7-21 14 0 $47,555.40 86,894.00$             

8-21 3 0 $63,507.20 91,084.00$             

10-21 2 0 $29,166.40 33,660.00$             

11-21 1 0 $10,832.20 13,070.00$             

12-21 0 0 $7,739.50 -$                       

13-21 2 0 $26,529.40 36,290.00$             

14-21 0 0 $34,985.80 -$                       

15-21 1 0 $6,522.80 6,724.00$               

16-21 3 0 $22,737.00 43,290.00$             

17-21 0 0 $22,621.80 -$                       

18-21 10 0 $132,325.00 194,932.50$           

19-21 0 0 $20,529.60 -$                       

20-21 0 0 $16,876.80 -$                       

21-21 10 0 $51,335.00 65,201.50$             

22-21 1 0 $12,816.60 15,445.00$             

23-21 0 0 $21,873.80 -$                       

24-21 0 0 $7,829.20 -$                       

*25-21 2 0 $12,405.62 13,000.00$             

*26-21 4 0 $12,145.05 16,122.85$             

Totals 88 1 $1,218,376.77 1,401,206.75$        

*lump sum

June Bid Opening

Direct Sale

43 $1,018,798.77

27 1,401,206.75$        

27 38%

16

89 27,449.00

88 1017

3.3 51.05$                    

1,716.00

64

816.55$                  

Number of Tracts Receiving Bids Total Bid Value of Tracts Sold

Cord Equivalent Volume Sold

Total Number of Qualifying Bids Average Cord Equivalent/Sold Tract

Unsold

No Bid

Byers Forestry

Tlusty Logging

Average Acreage of Sold Tracts

No Bid

Total Appraised Value of Tracts Sold

Lake States Timber

Gallick Logging

Average $ per Acre Sold 

Average $ per Cord Equivalent Sold

Number of Tracts Offered

Number of Tracts with Qualifying Bids

Twin Forest Products

Kron Forest Products

Schreiner Forestry

Schreiner Forestry

Percent Increase Over Appraised Value

No Bid

Weyer Logging

No Bid

Tract 

Number

Number of Bids

High Bidder Appraised Value

No Bid

Tlusty Logging

Northwest Hardwoods

No Bid

Bid Value

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Schreiner Forestry

Flannel Fleet Logging

Flannel Fleet Logging

Schreiner Forestry

Schreiner Forestry

Flannel Fleet Logging

Ryder Logging

Northwest Hardwoods

Schreiner Forestry

Flannel Fleet Logging

Nicholas Syryczuk

No Bid

Flannel Fleet Logging

No Bid

Buffalo Lumber & Tie

No Bid

Dairyland Forest Products

No Bid

Acres Sold

Number of Tracts with No Bids

Total Number of Bids

Avg. Number of Qualifying Bids Per Tract

Tlusty Logging

No Bid

McFarland Cascade

No Bid
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Timber Sale Tracts #30-19, #39-19, #45-19, #48-19, 
#15-20, #20-20, #35-20, #41-20, #49-20, #12-21, 
#14-21, #17-21, #19-21, #20-21, #23-21, and #24-21 
did not sell on the June 3, 2021 Clark County Forest 
timber sale bid opening. These tracts are available 
for direct purchase at 10% above minimum bid 
value unless otherwise agreed upon by the Forestry 
and Parks Department as per department policy.  
Contact the Clark County Forestry Department for 
more information.  Thank you. 
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