
tons cords per ton per cord per ton per cord per ton per cord

Aspen Pulp 4980 2213 $10.27 $23.12 $17.00 $38.25 $8.00 $18.00

Aspen Bolts 390 173 $24.41 $54.92 $28.00 $63.00 $24.00 $54.00

Oak Pulp 7170 2607 $10.80 $29.70 $15.00 $41.25 $6.00 $16.50

Oak Bolts 2910 1058 $21.66 $59.57 $28.00 $77.00 $12.00 $33.00

Mixed Hardwood Pulp 4775 2076 $10.24 $23.55 $15.00 $34.50 $8.00 $18.40

Tamarack 0 0 #DIV/0! #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Basswood Pulp 240 124 $11.00 $21.23 $11.00 $21.23 $11.00 $21.23

Mixed Hardwood Bolts 360 157 $23.21 $53.39 $28.00 $64.40 $13.50 $31.05

Jack Pine Pulp 435 204 $10.00 $21.30 $10.00 $21.30 $10.00 $21.30

Red Pine Pulp 0 0 #DIV/0! #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

White Pine Pulp 830 395 $10.13 $21.28 $15.00 $31.50 $9.50 $19.95

Red Pine Comingled 6880 3058 $28.76 $64.70 $32.00 $72.00 $22.00 $49.50

White Pine Comingled 3205 1526 $22.98 $48.26 $28.00 $58.80 $10.00 $21.00

Red Oak Sawlog

White Oak Sawlog

Black Oak Sawlog

Red Maple Sawlog

Sugar Maple Sawlog

Mixed Hardwood Sawlog

Red Pine Sawlogs

White Pine Sawlogs

mbfmbf

925 $363.54 $395.00 $270.00

 AVERAGE SUCCESSFUL BIDS – As of November 6, 2019

Clark County Forest

Species/Type
Volume Weighted Average High Low

mbfmbf

137 $319.30 $395.00 $200.00

64 $157.81 $300.00 $125.00

0 #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00

0 #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00

139 $283.82 $365.00 $130.00

0 #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00

111 $120.81 $125.00 $120.00



TIMBER SALE BID RESULTS November 6, 2019

CLARK COUNTY FOREST

Qualified Non-Qualified

55-16 0 0 $11,151.20 -$                       

23-17 0 0 $1,633.50 -$                       

10-19 0 0 $471.30 -$                       

16-19 0 0 $14,868.00 -$                       

12-19 5 0 $111,127.20 126,955.00$          

14-19 7 0 $105,028.60 129,880.00$          

17-19 5 0 $37,750.60 44,052.00$            

26-19 0 0 $8,590.65 -$                       

27-19 1 0 $12,646.80 13,730.00$            

29-19 0 0 $20,093.00 -$                       

30-19 0 0 $10,240.40 -$                       

31-19 6 0 $58,291.20 62,775.00$            

32-19 1 0 $11,456.40 12,150.00$            

33-19 1 0 $44,809.10 56,620.00$            

34-19 0 0 $35,286.60 -$                       

35-19 0 0 $6,194.25 -$                       

36-19 1 0 $48,213.30 54,935.00$            

37-19 0 0 $11,609.20 -$                       

38-19 0 0 $27,808.00 -$                       

39-19 0 0 $9,190.10 -$                       

40-19 1 0 $31,928.40 32,721.80$            

41-19 2 0 $89,695.00 102,990.00$          

42-19 1 0 $41,856.70 44,330.00$            

43-19 1 0 $7,226.10 8,305.00$              

44-19 1 0 $21,497.10 21,577.50$            

45-19 0 0 $11,454.30 -$                       

46-19 1 0 $27,621.70 29,705.00$            

47-19 6 0 $117,116.80 145,769.00$          

48-19 0 0 $6,026.50 -$                       

49-19 1 0 $47,008.50 50,495.00$            

50-19 0 0 $44,227.30 -$                       

51-19 5 0 $19,594.20 21,645.00$            

52-19 3 0 $36,588.30 44,420.00$            

Totals 49 0 $1,088,300.30 1,003,055.30$       

*lump sum

33 $869,456.00

18 1,003,055.30$       

18 15%

15

49 16,752.00

49 931

2.7 59.88$                   

1,103.00

61

909.39$                 

Byers Forestry

No Bid

Burkey's Lumber LLC

Total Appraised Value of Tracts Sold

Number of Tracts Receiving Bids Total Bid Value of Tracts Sold

Ryder Logging

Kron Logging

No Bid

Ryder Logging

Nicholas Syryczuk

No Bid

Tract 

Number

Number of Bids

High Bidder Appraised Value Bid Value

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Theodore Strzok Logging

Byers Forestry

Nicholas Syryczuk

No Bid

Kron Logging

No Bid

No Bid

Theodore Strzok Logging

Ryder Logging

Wiitala & Vozka

No Bid

No Bid

Ryder Logging

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Burkey's Lumber LLC

Wiitala & Vozka

Kron Logging

Byers Forestry

Avg. Number of Qualifying Bids Per Tract

Total Number of Qualifying Bids Average Cord Equivalent/Sold Tract

Number of Tracts Offered

Acres Sold

Average Acreage of Sold Tracts

Average $ per Acre Sold 

Number of Tracts with Qualifying Bids

Total Number of Bids Cord Equivalent Volume Sold

Average $ per Cord Equivalent Sold

Percent Increase Over Appraised Value

Number of Tracts with No Bids
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