
tons cords per ton per cord per ton per cord per ton per cord

Aspen Pulp 13140 5840 $12.58 $28.30 $19.10 $42.98 $5.00 $11.25

Aspen Bolts 1500 667 $12.77 $28.73 $19.10 $42.98 $8.00 $18.00

Oak Pulp 5720 2080 $7.28 $20.01 $11.50 $31.63 $3.65 $10.04

Oak Bolts 2005 729 $20.56 $56.53 $31.60 $86.90 $6.00 $16.50

Mixed Hardwood Pulp 6310 2743 $6.80 $15.64 $11.50 $26.45 $4.00 $9.20

Tamarack 0 0 #DIV/0! #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Basswood Pulp 140 73 $0.25 $0.48 $0.25 $0.48 $0.25 $0.48

Mixed Hardwood Bolts 115 50 $16.62 $38.22 $22.00 $50.60 $6.52 $15.00

Jack Pine Pulp 80 38 $12.79 $27.24 $12.79 $27.24 $12.79 $27.24

Red Pine Pulp 0 0 #DIV/0! #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

White Pine Pulp 595 283 $8.64 $18.15 $15.60 $32.76 $6.00 $12.60

Red Pine Comingled 9580 4258 $32.29 $72.64 $38.20 $85.95 $16.00 $36.00

White Pine Comingled 4265 2031 $20.81 $43.69 $27.10 $56.91 $5.00 $10.50

Red Oak Sawlog

White Oak Sawlog

Black Oak Sawlog

Red Maple Sawlog

Sugar Maple Sawlog

Mixed Hardwood Sawlog

Red Pine Sawlogs

White Pine Sawlogs

mbfmbf

526.18 $354.88 $380.00 $270.00

 AVERAGE SUCCESSFUL BIDS – As of November 12, 2020

Clark County Forest

Species/Type
Volume Weighted Average High Low

mbfmbf

126.9 $339.18 $400.00 $170.00

40 $174.25 $275.00 $120.00

17.76 $241.77 $380.00 $130.00

0 #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00

56 $265.00 $370.00 $130.00

22.2 $175.23 $200.00 $150.00

186.9 $123.70 $160.00 $120.00



TIMBER SALE BID RESULTS December 10, 2020

CLARK COUNTY FOREST

Qualified Non-Qualified

16-19 1 0 $9,236.00 9,255.75$              

30-19 0 0 $8,264.00 -$                       

39-19 0 0 $9,190.10 -$                       

45-19 0 0 $7,013.00 -$                       

48-19 0 0 $4,963.00 -$                       

50-19 1 0 $44,227.30 44,889.05$            

6-20 0 0 $7,326.00 -$                       

8-20 2 0 $6,796.00 14,115.00$            

14-20 1 0 $35,740.00 35,997.00$            

15-20 0 0 $9,541.80 -$                       

16-20 2 0 $139,504.90 156,030.00$          

17-20 0 0 $18,568.20 -$                       

20-20 0 0 $12,825.10 -$                       

21-20 0 0 $41,038.30 -$                       

23-20 0 0 $53,642.70 -$                       

24-20 1 0 $10,205.20 21,662.50$            

25-20 1 0 $65,225.60 66,860.00$            

26-20 0 0 $28,037.80 -$                       

27-20 0 0 $32,224.95 -$                       

28-20 8 0 $33,733.90 53,694.80$            

29-20 0 0 $20,478.00 -$                       

30-20 2 0 $17,373.70 20,899.40$            

31-20 1 0 $10,412.40 10,417.20$            

32-20 2 0 $14,826.30 17,785.00$            

33-20 1 0 $31,080.00 31,082.90$            

34-20 3 0 $21,724.20 22,757.80$            

35-20 0 0 $15,036.80 -$                       

36-20 6 0 $42,710.40 49,725.00$            

37-20 0 0 $16,480.50 -$                       

38-20 0 0 $22,714.25 -$                       

39-20 7 0 $46,238.00 61,507.00$            

40-20 0 0 $12,995.10 -$                       

41-20 0 0 $3,111.20 -$                       

42-20 6 0 $28,409.60 38,200.00$            

43-20 2 0 $14,146.00 14,460.00$            

44-20 8 0 $43,492.00 62,502.00$            

45-20 5 0 $109,961.45 137,915.00$          

46-20 3 0 $51,073.50 73,445.00$            

*47-20 6 0 $77,748.78 95,120.70$            

48-20 0 0 $26,095.40 -$                       

49-20 0 0 $7,678.00 -$                       

Totals 69 0 $1,211,089.43 1,038,321.10$       

*lump sum

December Bid Opening

Direct Sale

41 $914,127.98

21 1,038,321.10$       

21 14%

20

69 21,747.00

69 1036

3.3 47.75$                   

1,222.00

58

849.69$                 

No Bid

No Bid

Acres Sold

Number of Tracts with No Bids

Total Number of Bids

Avg. Number of Qualifying Bids Per Tract

No Bid

No Bid

Futurewood Corp

Russ Thums

Martin's Forestry

No Bid

No Bid

Lake States Timber

Ryder Logging

No Bid

Martin's Forestry

No Bid

TNT Timber

No Bid

No Bid

Futurewood Corp

Bid Value

Lake States Timber

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Kron Forest Products

Tract 

Number

Number of Bids

High Bidder Appraised Value

TNT Timber

No Bid

No Bid

Lake States Timber

Average $ per Acre Sold 

Average $ per Cord Equivalent Sold

Number of Tracts Offered

Number of Tracts with Qualifying Bids

Russ Thums

Buffalo Lumber & Tie

No Bid

Martin's Forestry

Percent Increase Over Appraised Value

No Bid

Kron Forest Products

Kron Forest Products

Kron Forest Products

Nicholas Syryczuk

Nicholas Syryczuk

Martin's Forestry

Average Acreage of Sold Tracts

No Bid

Total Appraised Value of Tracts Sold

Number of Tracts Receiving Bids Total Bid Value of Tracts Sold

Cord Equivalent Volume Sold

Total Number of Qualifying Bids Average Cord Equivalent/Sold Tract

Unsold
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Timber Sale Tracts #30-19, #39-19, #45-19, #48-19, 
#6-20, #15-20, #17-20, #20-20, #21-20, #23-20,    
#26-20, #27-20, #29-20, #35-20, #37-20, #38-20, 
#40-20, #41-20, #48-20, and #49-20 did not sell on 
the December 10, 2020 Clark County Forest timber 
sale bid opening. These tracts are available for 
direct purchase at 10% above minimum bid value 
unless otherwise agreed upon by the Forestry and 
Parks Department as per department policy.  
Contact the Clark County Forestry Department for 
more information.  Thank you. 
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