
tons cords per ton per cord per ton per cord per ton per cord

Aspen Pulp 3275 1456 $10.98 $24.70 $20.00 $45.00 $9.25 $20.81

Aspen Bolts 390 173 $19.63 $44.18 $24.00 $54.00 $14.00 $31.50

Oak Pulp 7655 2784 $11.66 $32.06 $15.00 $41.25 $6.00 $16.50

Oak Bolts 2670 971 $26.42 $72.65 $30.00 $82.50 $12.62 $34.71

Mixed Hardwood Pulp 3540 1539 $12.74 $29.31 $20.00 $46.00 $9.25 $21.28

Tamarack 0 0 #DIV/0! #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Basswood Pulp 0 0 #DIV/0! #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Mixed Hardwood Bolts 265 115 $27.26 $62.71 $35.87 $82.50 $15.00 $34.50

Jack Pine Pulp 0 0 #DIV/0! #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Red Pine Pulp 1270 564 $24.35 $54.79 $24.57 $55.28 $23.53 $52.94

White Pine Pulp 60 29 $18.50 $38.85 $18.50 $38.85 $18.50 $38.85

Red Pine Comingled 10135 4504 $33.50 $75.38 $42.00 $94.50 $12.00 $27.00

White Pine Comingled 6420 3057 $21.71 $45.60 $34.36 $72.16 $10.00 $21.00

Red Oak Sawlog

White Oak Sawlog

Black Oak Sawlog

Red Maple Sawlog

Sugar Maple Sawlog

Mixed Hardwood Sawlog

Red Pine Sawlogs

White Pine Sawlogs 15 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00

0 #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00

32 $320.94 $430.00 $130.00

0 #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00

45 $357.22 $475.00 $200.00

163 $214.69 $225.00 $120.00

mbfmbf

148.6 $393.55 $475.00 $170.00

 AVERAGE SUCCESSFUL BIDS – As of May 3, 2018

Clark County Forest

Species/Type
Volume Weighted Average High Low

mbfmbf

849.9 $453.65 $475.00 $270.00



TIMBER SALE BID RESULTS May 3, 2018

CLARK COUNTY FOREST

Qualified Non-Qualified

41-16 0 0 $13,034.60 -$                       

43-16 0 0 $14,649.40 -$                       

55-16 0 0 $11,151.20 -$                       

56-16 0 0 $11,857.20 -$                       

22-17 0 0 $4,084.80 -$                       

23-17 0 0 $1,633.50 -$                       

26-17 1 0 $22,538.50 22,543.40$            

38-17 1 0 $37,495.58 38,272.00$            

1-18 12 0 $31,310.00 45,001.20$            

2-18 2 0 $3,532.50 6,473.10$              

3-18 7 0 $104,670.50 148,998.50$          

4-18 3 0 $38,625.30 53,970.00$            

5-18 7 0 $180,433.05 264,179.05$          

6-18 8 0 $110,222.60 160,550.00$          

7-18 1 0 $58,710.80 70,597.50$            

8-18 3 0 $71,899.60 95,770.00$            

9-18 5 0 $17,360.00 24,930.00$            

10-18 2 0 $9,564.00 9,750.00$              

11-18 0 0 $11,952.40 -$                       

12-18 2 0 $18,211.30 19,130.00$            

13-18 2 0 $158,779.00 221,657.80$          

14-18 1 0 $4,860.00 5,725.00$              

15-18 4 0 $47,925.50 74,504.00$            

16-18 2 0 $16,887.80 19,875.00$            

Totals 63 0 1,001,389.13$      1,281,926.55$       

*lump sum

24 $933,026.03

17 1,281,926.55$       

17 37%

7

63 17,485.00

63 1029

3.7 73.32$                   

1,097.00

65

1,168.57$              

Acres Sold

Average Acreage of Sold Tracts

Average $ per Acre Sold 

Number of Tracts with Qualifying Bids

Total Number of Bids Cord Equivalent Volume Sold

Average $ per Cord Equivalent Sold

Russ Thums

Wiitala & Vozka

Ryder Logging

Landwehr Custom Logging

Ryder Logging

Avg. Number of Qualifying Bids Per Tract

Byers Forestry

Paul Wojcik

Wiitala & Vozka

Tlusty Logging, Inc

Ryder Logging

No Bid

Russ Thums

Tlusty Logging, Inc

Tlusty Logging, Inc

Byers Forestry

Wiitala & Vozka

Byers Forestry

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Russ Thums

Tract 

Number

Number of Bids

High Bidder Appraised Value Bid Value

No Bid

Total Number of Qualifying Bids Average Cord Equivalent/Sold Tract

Number of Tracts Offered Total Appraised Value of Tracts Sold

Number of Tracts Receiving Bids Total Bid Value of Tracts Sold

Percent Increase Over Appraised Value

Number of Tracts with No Bids
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