
tons cords per ton per cord per ton per cord per ton per cord

Aspen Pulp 7050 3133 $17.06 $38.37 $20.50 $46.13 $6.60 $14.85

Aspen Bolts 1180 524 $20.09 $45.21 $20.50 $46.13 $18.10 $40.73

Oak Pulp 8115 2951 $12.32 $33.89 $16.75 $46.06 $4.00 $11.00

Oak Bolts 3295 1198 $17.48 $48.06 $27.00 $74.25 $10.00 $27.50

Mixed Hardwood Pulp 5110 2222 $13.35 $30.70 $17.50 $40.25 $6.50 $14.95

Tamarack 0 0 #DIV/0! #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Basswood Pulp 0 0 #DIV/0! #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Mixed Hardwood Bolts 0 0 #DIV/0! #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Jack Pine Pulp 205 96 $15.82 $33.69 $18.02 $38.38 $15.20 $32.38

Red Pine Pulp 0 0 #DIV/0! #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

White Pine Pulp 800 381 $11.08 $23.27 $20.00 $42.00 $4.40 $9.24

Red Pine Comingled 2765 1229 $24.62 $55.40 $34.67 $78.01 $15.00 $33.75

White Pine Comingled 1690 805 $24.58 $51.62 $26.00 $54.60 $18.00 $37.80

Red Oak Sawlog

White Oak Sawlog

Black Oak Sawlog

Red Maple Sawlog

Sugar Maple Sawlog

Mixed Hardwood Sawlog

Red Pine Sawlogs

White Pine Sawlogs 233 $120.41 $125.00 $120.00

17 $120.00 $120.00 $120.00

61 $209.26 $340.00 $130.00

0 #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00

0 #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00

91 $231.76 $270.00 $150.00

mbfmbf

256.76 $304.28 $450.00 $170.00

 AVERAGE SUCCESSFUL BIDS – As of May 7, 2020

Clark County Forest

Species/Type
Volume Weighted Average High Low

mbfmbf

874.08 $340.56 $380.00 $270.00



TIMBER SALE BID RESULTS May 7, 2020

CLARK COUNTY FOREST

Qualified Non-Qualified

55-16 0 0 $11,151.20 -$                       

23-17 0 0 $1,633.50 -$                       

10-19 0 0 $471.30 -$                       

16-19 0 0 $12,427.20 -$                       

26-19 2 0 $8,590.65 8,619.70$              

29-19 1 0 $17,585.50 17,610.00$            

30-19 0 0 $8,264.00 -$                       

34-19 1 0 $35,286.60 45,980.00$            

35-19 5 0 $5,567.00 6,797.50$              

37-19 4 0 $9,848.50 13,162.00$            

39-19 0 0 $9,190.10 -$                       

45-19 0 0 $9,652.50 -$                       

48-19 0 0 $4,963.00 -$                       

50-19 0 0 $44,227.30 -$                       

1-20 2 1 $165,123.90 182,040.00$          

2-20 1 0 $42,820.40 43,120.00$            

3-20 1 0 $63,895.80 63,908.50$            

*4-20 2 0 $35,138.84 35,377.00$            

5-20 3 0 $37,399.70 45,560.00$            

6-20 0 0 $9,785.70 -$                       

7-20 1 0 $27,744.00 27,768.00$            

8-20 0 0 $10,277.70 -$                       

9-20 2 0 $98,964.40 113,315.00$          

10-20 3 0 $73,612.30 79,497.00$            

11-20 2 0 $25,129.50 37,191.00$            

12-20 7 0 $17,917.90 25,811.00$            

13-20 6 0 $21,750.00 30,162.90$            

14-20 0 0 $35,740.00 -$                       

15-20 0 0 $13,632.40 -$                       

16-20 0 0 $139,504.90 -$                       

17-20 0 0 $25,901.00 -$                       

18-20 0 0 $138,349.50 -$                       

19-20 1 0 $40,826.10 42,850.00$            

20-20 0 0 $12,825.10 -$                       

21-20 0 0 $52,274.70 -$                       

22-20 5 0 $133,170.00 176,350.00$          

23-20 0 0 $68,004.90 -$                       

24-20 0 0 $14,599.60 -$                       

25-20 0 0 $83,748.50 -$                       

26-20 0 0 $38,538.70 -$                       

Totals 49 1 $1,605,533.89 995,119.60$          

*lump sum

40 $860,371.09

18 995,119.60$          

18 16%

22

50 16,794.00

49 933

2.7 59.25$                   

1,139.00

63

873.68$                 

No Bid

No Bid

Average $ per Cord Equivalent Sold

Number of Tracts Receiving Bids

Number of Tracts with No Bids

Total Number of Bids

Total Number of Qualifying Bids Average Cord Equivalent/Sold Tract
Avg. Number of Qualifying Bids Per Tract

Country Forest Products

No Bid

Frank Gurklis Logging

No Bid

Theodore Strzok Logging

Twin Forest Products LLC

No Bid

Theodore Strzok Logging

Yoder Logging

Russ Thums

Martin's Forestry

Byers Forestry

Kron Forest Products LLC

Bridge Creek Logging

Landwehr Custom Logging

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Tlusty Logging Inc

Russ Thums

No Bid

Tract 

Number

Number of Bids

High Bidder Appraised Value Bid Value

No Bid

Ule Logging

Weaver Forest Products

Bridge Creek Logging

No Bid

Total Bid Value of Tracts Sold

Percent Increase Over Appraised Value

Total Appraised Value of Tracts Sold

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Average Acreage of Sold Tracts

Average $ per Acre Sold 

June Bid Opening

Direct Sale

Unsold

Acres Sold

Cord Equivalent Volume Sold

Number of Tracts Offered

Number of Tracts with Qualifying Bids

No Bid

No Bid

Theodore Strzok Logging

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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Timber Sale Tracts #55-16, #23-17, #10-19, #16-19, 
#30-19, #39-19, #45-19, #48-19, #50-19, #6-20,    
#8-20, #14-20, #15-20, #16-20, #17-20, #18-20,  
#20-20, #21-20, #23-20, #24-20, #25-20 and #26-20 
did not sell on the June 4, 2020 Clark County Forest 
timber sale bid opening. These tracts are available 
for direct purchase at 10% above minimum bid 
value unless otherwise agreed upon by the Forestry 
and Parks Department as per department policy.  
Contact the Clark County Forestry Department for 
more information.  Thank you. 
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