
tons cords per ton per cord per ton per cord per ton per cord

Aspen Pulp 12524 5566 $15.27 $34.36 $20.89 $47.00 $8.00 $18.00

Aspen Bolts 2500 1111 $23.04 $51.85 $28.00 $63.00 $10.00 $22.50

Oak Pulp 12691 4615 $9.14 $25.13 $20.00 $55.00 $4.00 $11.00

Oak Bolts 4856 1766 $23.40 $64.34 $36.00 $99.00 $10.63 $29.23

Mixed Hardwood Pulp 9433 4101 $13.73 $31.59 $20.00 $46.00 $5.00 $11.50

Tamarack 0 0 #DIV/0! #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Basswood Pulp 0 0 #DIV/0! #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Mixed Hardwood Bolts 630 274 $25.53 $58.73 $30.00 $69.00 $20.00 $46.00

Jack Pine Pulp 145 68 $9.76 $20.79 $20.00 $42.60 $7.00 $14.91

Red Pine Pulp 303 135 $16.51 $37.15 $22.50 $50.63 $14.00 $31.50

White Pine Pulp 1427 680 $15.34 $32.22 $20.00 $42.00 $7.00 $14.70

Red Pine Comingled 6770 3009 $37.84 $85.14 $42.00 $94.50 $17.59 $39.58

White Pine Comingled 880 419 $26.55 $55.75 $35.12 $73.75 $15.00 $31.50

Red Oak Sawlog

White Oak Sawlog

Black Oak Sawlog

Red Maple Sawlog

Sugar Maple Sawlog

Mixed Hardwood Sawlog

Red Pine Sawlogs

White Pine Sawlogs 193.72 $142.67 $160.00 $120.00

87.4 $137.95 $150.00 $130.00

122 $220.37 $300.00 $130.00

0 #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00

54.8 $286.92 $460.00 $150.00

112.8 $184.58 $300.00 $120.00

mbfmbf

414.2 $324.72 $450.00 $170.00

 AVERAGE SUCCESSFUL BIDS – May 4, 2017

Clark County Forest

Species/Type
Volume Weighted Average High Low

mbfmbf

1101.9 $430.00 $505.00 $270.00



TIMBER SALE BID RESULTS May 4, 2017

CLARK COUNTY FOREST

Qualified Non-Qualified

33-15 0 0 $7,578.15 -$                        

38-16 1 0 $20,003.15 20,643.75$             

39-16 0 0 $12,828.90 -$                        

41-16 0 0 $18,146.30 -$                        

43-16 0 0 $14,828.65 -$                        

47-16 1 0 $7,810.00 8,650.00$               

49-16 1 0 $11,438.10 11,920.00$             

51-16 0 0 $22,813.60 -$                        

55-16 0 0 $15,978.40 -$                        

56-16 0 0 $15,606.40 -$                        

57-16 2 0 $39,516.20 52,124.70$             

1-17 0 0 $22,020.00 -$                        

2-17* 5 0 $44,374.00 68,445.20$             

3-17* 3 0 $44,935.00 59,777.36$             

4-17 0 0 $14,403.75 -$                        

5-17 1 0 $32,256.00 32,486.25$             

6-17 2 1 $19,505.00 23,460.00$             

7-17 1 0 $9,969.80 11,890.00$             

8-17 4 0 $31,810.00 33,750.10$             

9-17 2 0 $40,044.90 55,291.50$             

10-17 3 0 $25,008.80 46,107.90$             

11-17 4 0 $34,816.40 51,845.00$             

12-17 2 0 $44,905.00 79,961.50$             

13-17 0 0 $11,719.50 -$                        

14-17 1 0 $9,159.40 9,227.00$               

15-17 7 0 $73,094.69 116,977.00$          

16-17* 7 0 $176,319.00 275,087.91$          

17-17 0 0 $4,206.40 -$                        

18-17 1 0 $27,430.00 53,620.00$             

19-17* 6 0 $37,261.40 58,989.20$             

20-17 5 0 $83,953.60 105,600.00$          

21-17 4 0 $38,482.55 47,411.25$             

22-17 0 0 $5,866.80 -$                        

24-17 1 0 $43,869.50 43,914.50$             

25-17 5 0 $43,740.00 55,637.20$             

26-17 0 0 $27,136.00 -$                        

27-17 0 0 $30,968.00 -$                        

28-17 0 0 $46,537.80 -$                        

29-17* 1 0 $8,336.61 22,959.00$             

30-17 7 0 $46,285.00 59,865.00$             

31-17 5 0 $34,680.00 43,747.60$             

32-17 4 0 $50,534.20 87,150.00$             

33-17 3 0 $23,465.00 27,045.00$             

34-17 2 0 $75,015.00 86,103.50$             

Totals 91 1 1,448,656.95$      1,649,687.42$       

*lump sum

44 $1,104,923.61

29 1,649,687.42$       

29 49%

15

92 27,147.00

91 936

3.1 60.77$                    

1,467.00

51

1,124.53$               

Avg. Number of Qualifying Bids Per Tract

Acres Sold

Average Acreage of Sold Tracts

Average $ per Acre Sold 

Northwest Hardwoods Inc

Luke Brunner Tree Removal

Delaney Forest Products

Number of Tracts with Qualifying Bids

Total Number of Bids Cord Equivalent Volume Sold

Marth Wood Products

Lake States Timber

Luke Brunner Tree Removal

Delaney Forest Products

No Bid

Kron Logging

Buffalo Lumber & Tie

No Bid

Lambert Forest Products

Country Forest Products

TJ Raese & Company LLC

Russ Thums

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Delaney Forest Products

No Bid

Luke Brunner Tree Removal

TJ Raese & Company LLC

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Ule Logging

TJ Raese & Company LLC

Tract 

Number

Number of Bids

High Bidder Appraised Value Bid Value

No Bid

Average $ per Cord Equivalent Sold

Number of Tracts Offered Total Appraised Value of Tracts Sold

Number of Tracts Receiving Bids Total Bid Value of Tracts Sold

Percent Increase Over Appraised Value

Number of Tracts with No Bids

Total Number of Qualifying Bids Average Cord Equivalent/Sold Tract

Twin Forest Products LLC

No Bid

Ule Logging

Northwest Hardwoods Inc

Wiitala & Vozka

TJ Raese & Company LLC

Tlusty Logging Inc

Wiitala & Vozka

Bridge Creek Logging

Ule Logging

No Bid

Burkey's Lumber LLC

McFarland Cascade

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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