
tons cords per ton per cord per ton per cord per ton per cord

Aspen Pulp 10380 4613 $9.11 $20.51 $15.50 $34.88 $7.46 $16.79

Aspen Bolts 1550 689 $18.74 $42.17 $33.00 $74.25 $8.00 $18.00

Oak Pulp 8935 3249 $10.13 $27.86 $16.50 $45.38 $4.00 $11.00

Oak Bolts 3015 1096 $19.64 $54.01 $31.00 $85.25 $5.00 $13.75

Mixed Hardwood Pulp 8135 3537 $12.49 $28.72 $20.00 $46.00 $6.25 $14.38

Tamarack 0 0 #DIV/0! #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Basswood Pulp 90 47 $11.00 $21.23 $11.00 $21.23 $11.00 $21.23

Mixed Hardwood Bolts 645 280 $18.21 $41.87 $29.00 $66.70 $11.00 $25.30

Jack Pine Pulp 55 26 $40.22 $85.67 $40.22 $85.67 $40.22 $85.67

Red Pine Pulp 280 124 $13.00 $29.25 $13.00 $29.25 $13.00 $29.25

White Pine Pulp 1925 917 $12.98 $27.25 $16.00 $33.60 $5.71 $11.99

Red Pine Comingled 7060 3138 $35.23 $79.27 $40.26 $90.59 $20.00 $45.00

White Pine Comingled 1840 876 $22.81 $47.90 $40.26 $84.55 $10.00 $21.00

Red Oak Sawlog

White Oak Sawlog

Black Oak Sawlog

Red Maple Sawlog

Sugar Maple Sawlog

Mixed Hardwood Sawlog

Red Pine Sawlogs

White Pine Sawlogs

mbfmbf

473.06 $368.70 $428.00 $270.00

 AVERAGE SUCCESSFUL BIDS – As of December 7, 2017

Clark County Forest

Species/Type
Volume Weighted Average High Low

mbfmbf

251.26 $329.54 $425.00 $170.00

161.15 $217.95 $425.00 $120.00

73.03 $233.21 $275.00 $130.00

0 #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00

98 $212.82 $416.58 $140.00

0 #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00

299.67 $128.24 $215.00 $120.00



TIMBER SALE BID RESULTS November 11, 2017

CLARK COUNTY FOREST

Qualified Non-Qualified

41-16 0 0 $18,146.30 -$                       

43-16 0 0 $14,828.65 -$                       

49-16 1 0 $11,438.10 11,925.00$            

51-16 0 0 $22,813.60 -$                       

55-16 0 0 $15,978.40 -$                       

56-16 0 0 $15,606.40 -$                       

1-17 1 0 $16,515.00 18,103.00$            

4-17 1 0 $14,403.75 15,755.00$            

7-17 1 0 $9,969.80 10,460.00$            

17-17 1 0 $3,563.20 4,040.00$              

22-17 0 0 $5,866.80 -$                       

23-17 0 0 $2,178.00 -$                       

26-17 0 0 $27,136.00 -$                       

35-17 2 0 $23,085.00 29,672.00$            

36-17 4 0 $50,635.00 83,516.00$            

38-17 0 0 $48,441.38 -$                       

39-17 2 0 $49,960.00 52,244.75$            

40-17* 3 0 $45,660.00 52,040.00$            

41-17 0 0 $20,657.70 -$                       

42-17 8 0 $48,140.40 92,908.20$            

43-17 2 0 $26,153.40 30,160.00$            

44-17* 5 0 $32,513.30 54,165.25$            

45-17 2 0 $7,070.00 11,505.00$            

46-17 5 0 $82,310.00 106,560.00$          

47-17 7 0 $63,859.40 87,704.20$            

48-17* 5 0 $34,008.40 51,655.00$            

49-17 2 0 $21,497.20 24,434.00$            

50-17 4 0 $12,332.50 14,000.00$            

51-17 0 0 $34,694.60 -$                       

52-17 5 0 $55,590.00 83,400.00$            

53-17 0 0 $25,987.60 -$                       

54-17 0 0 $36,752.00 -$                       

55-17 4 0 $68,580.00 74,410.00$            

56-17 1 0 $44,568.60 44,880.00$            

Totals 66 0 1,010,940.48$      953,537.40$          

*lump sum

34 $721,853.05

21 953,537.40$          

21 32%

13

66 16,746.60

66 797

3.1 56.94$                   

1,093.00

52

872.40$                 

Avg. Number of Qualifying Bids Per Tract

Acres Sold

Average Acreage of Sold Tracts

Average $ per Acre Sold 

Nicholas Syryczuk

Number of Tracts with Qualifying Bids

Total Number of Bids Cord Equivalent Volume Sold

Average $ per Cord Equivalent Sold

Bridge Creek Logging

Solberg Trucking LLC

Kuehn Forest Products

Solberg Trucking LLC

Northwest Hardwoods Inc

Bridge Creek Logging

Solberg Trucking LLC

Country Forest Products

No Bid

Burkey's Lumber LLC

Wiitala & Vozka

No Bid

Solberg Trucking LLC

Buffalo Lumber & Tie

Solberg Trucking LLC

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Ryder Logging

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Jelinek Trucking Inc.

Tract 

Number

Number of Bids

High Bidder Appraised Value Bid Value

No Bid

Number of Tracts Offered Total Appraised Value of Tracts Sold

Number of Tracts Receiving Bids Total Bid Value of Tracts Sold

Percent Increase Over Appraised Value

Number of Tracts with No Bids

Total Number of Qualifying Bids Average Cord Equivalent/Sold Tract

Northwest Hardwoods Inc

Kron Logging

Country Forest Products

Dairyland Forest Products

No Bid

Tlusty Logging, Inc

No Bid

No Bid
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