
tons cords per ton per cord per ton per cord per ton per cord

Aspen Pulp 11150 4956 $11.51 $25.89 $18.15 $40.84 $4.00 $9.00

Aspen Bolts 1930 858 $18.35 $41.29 $24.00 $54.00 $12.35 $27.79

Oak Pulp 9330 3393 $8.04 $22.12 $18.15 $49.91 $2.00 $5.50

Oak Bolts 3680 1338 $18.77 $51.62 $31.70 $87.18 $9.00 $24.75

Mixed Hardwood Pulp 7180 3122 $7.33 $16.85 $18.15 $41.75 $2.00 $4.60

Tamarack 0 0 #DIV/0! #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Basswood Pulp 150 78 $0.11 $0.21 $0.11 $0.21 $0.11 $0.21

Mixed Hardwood Bolts 140 61 $25.00 $57.50 $25.00 $57.50 $25.00 $57.50

Jack Pine Pulp 0 0 #DIV/0! #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Red Pine Pulp 20 9 $6.00 $13.50 $6.00 $13.50 $6.00 $13.50

White Pine Pulp 1750 833 $12.44 $26.12 $18.00 $37.80 $5.00 $10.50

*Red Pine Comingled 6435 2860 $47.49 $106.86 $54.20 $121.95 $13.00 $29.25

*White Pine Comingled 1495 712 $14.46 $30.37 $35.00 $73.50 $5.00 $10.50

Red Oak Sawlog

White Oak Sawlog

Black Oak Sawlog

Red Maple Sawlog

Sugar Maple Sawlog

Mixed Hardwood Sawlog

Red Pine Sawlogs

White Pine Sawlogs

*Includes Pine Bolts Sold

mbfmbf
697.52 $471.97 $558.00 $275.00

 AVERAGE SUCCESSFUL BIDS – As of November 4, 2021
Clark County Forest

Species/Type Volume Weighted Average High Low

mbfmbf

332.88 $516.14 $710.00 $170.00

75 $143.67 $150.00 $125.00

34 $370.85 $600.00 $135.00

0 #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00

75.38 $342.97 $460.00 $180.00

55 $145.91 $150.00 $125.00

87 $124.02 $125.00 $120.00



TIMBER SALE BID RESULTS November 4, 2021

CLARK COUNTY FOREST

Qualified Non-Qualified

30-19 0 0 $5,129.20 -$                       

39-19 0 0 $5,895.70 -$                       

45-19 0 0 $5,915.00 -$                       

48-19 0 0 $2,504.80 -$                       

15-20 0 0 $6,652.00 -$                       

20-20 0 0 $8,921.00 -$                       

35-20 0 0 $13,170.00 -$                       

41-20 0 0 $1,740.00 -$                       

49-20 0 0 $5,480.00 -$                       

12-21 0 0 $6,872.00 -$                       

14-21 0 0 $29,312.00 -$                       

17-21 1 0 $19,511.00 19,535.95$            

19-21 0 0 $16,505.00 -$                       

20-21 0 0 $14,745.20 -$                       

23-21 2 0 $19,375.80 21,030.00$            

24-21 0 0 $4,546.00 -$                       

27-21 3 0 $32,399.20 43,715.00$            

28-21 7 1 $109,544.70 200,525.00$          

29-21 0 0 $19,652.00 -$                       

30-21 4 1 $68,539.60 139,524.00$          

31-21 2 0 $12,147.00 15,980.00$            

32-21 1 0 $6,456.30 10,880.00$            

*33-21 1 0 $16,530.80 20,608.40$            

34-21 7 1 $46,470.90 73,662.50$            

35-21 2 0 $20,762.15 31,395.00$            

36-21 6 0 $17,306.80 31,294.40$            

37-21 1 0 $14,484.80 14,700.00$            

38-21 1 0 $42,629.15 59,069.80$            

39-21 4 0 $44,210.20 61,801.10$            

41-21 5 0 $38,008.00 68,988.00$            

42-21 4 0 $33,182.60 54,500.00$            

43-21 4 0 $27,252.40 41,705.00$            

44-21 5 0 $24,580.00 43,278.00$            

45-21 1 0 $62,636.10 63,290.00$            

47-21 3 1 $89,564.40 117,655.00$          

48-21 0 0 $65,420.40 -$                       

49-21 2 1 $108,944.20 156,900.00$          

Totals 66 5 $1,066,996.40 1,290,037.15$       

*lump sum

37 $854,536.10

21 1,290,037.15$       

21 51%

16

71 21,356.00

66 1017

3.1 60.41$                   

1,204.00

57

1,071.46$              

Central Wisconsin Lumber

Kron Forest Products

Lake States Timber

Flannel Fleet Logging

Bridge Creek Logging

Central Wisconsin Lumber

Central Wisconsin Lumber

No Bid

Dairyland Forest Products

Biewer Sawmill

Bridge Creek Logging

Central Wisconsin Lumber

Tigerton Lumber

Futurewood Corporation

Flannel Fleet Logging

Schreiner Forestry

No Bid

No Bid

Yoder Logging

No Bid

Central Wisconsin Lumber

Martin's Forestry

Lake States Timber

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Tract 

Number

Number of Bids

High Bidder Appraised Value

No Bid

Bid Value

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Average $ per Acre Sold 

Number of Tracts with Qualifying Bids Percent Increase Over Appraised Value

Number of Tracts with No Bids

Total Number of Bids

Theodore Strzok Logging

Total Number of Qualifying Bids Average Cord Equivalent/Sold Tract

Theodore Strzok Logging

Cord Equivalent Volume Sold

Avg. Number of Qualifying Bids Per Tract Average $ per Cord Equivalent Sold

Total Appraised Value of Tracts Sold

Acres Sold

Average Acreage of Sold Tracts

Number of Tracts Offered

Number of Tracts Receiving Bids Total Bid Value of Tracts Sold
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Timber Sale Tracts #30-19, #39-19, #45-19, #48-19, 
#15-20, #20-20, #35-20, #41-20, #49-20, #12-21, 
#14-21, #19-21, #20-21, #24-21, 29-21, and #48-21 
did not sell on the November 4, 2021 Clark County 
Forest timber sale bid opening. These tracts are 
available for the December 9, 2021 bid opening.  
Contact the Clark County Forestry Department for 
more information.  Thank you. 
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