
tons cords per ton per cord per ton per cord per ton per cord

Aspen Pulp 10165 4518 $14.77 $33.23 $18.85 $42.41 $8.65 $19.46

Aspen Bolts 840 373 $20.82 $46.85 $31.00 $69.75 $15.00 $33.75

Oak Pulp 12220 4444 $13.17 $36.22 $17.86 $49.12 $5.50 $15.13

Oak Bolts 4425 1609 $25.31 $69.61 $35.00 $96.25 $11.00 $30.25

Mixed Hardwood Pulp 6260 2722 $14.39 $33.09 $17.50 $40.25 $9.30 $21.39

Tamarack 0 0 #DIV/0! #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Basswood Pulp 330 171 $5.00 $9.65 $5.00 $9.65 $5.00 $9.65

Mixed Hardwood Bolts 495 215 $23.08 $53.09 $33.50 $77.05 $11.00 $25.30

Jack Pine Pulp 4380 2056 $13.75 $29.29 $13.75 $29.29 $13.75 $29.29

Red Pine Pulp 15 7 $9.00 $20.25 $9.00 $20.25 $9.00 $20.25

White Pine Pulp 950 452 $16.20 $34.02 $21.77 $45.72 $9.64 $20.24

Red Pine Comingled 8315 3696 $31.86 $71.69 $36.00 $81.00 $13.75 $30.94

White Pine Comingled 3910 1862 $25.57 $53.69 $34.00 $71.40 $13.75 $28.88

Red Oak Sawlog

White Oak Sawlog

Black Oak Sawlog

Red Maple Sawlog

Sugar Maple Sawlog

Mixed Hardwood Sawlog

Red Pine Sawlogs

White Pine Sawlogs 184.34 $145.14 $155.00 $120.00

7 $120.00 $120.00 $120.00

80 $323.50 $370.00 $200.00

0 #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00

81.52 $273.37 $400.00 $175.00

7 $154.29 $200.00 $120.00

mbfmbf

335.16 $370.68 $430.00 $200.00

 AVERAGE SUCCESSFUL BIDS – As of May 8, 2019

Clark County Forest

Species/Type
Volume Weighted Average High Low

mbfmbf

1127.38 $384.36 $430.00 $290.00



TIMBER SALE BID RESULTS May 8, 2019

CLARK COUNTY FOREST

Qualified Non-Qualified

41-16 0 0 $13,034.60 -$                       

55-16 0 0 $11,151.20 -$                       

22-17 0 0 $4,084.80 -$                       

23-17 0 0 $1,633.50 -$                       

26-18 1 0 $24,278.00 24,283.20$            

31-18 1 0 $78,488.70 83,877.10$            

1-19 8 0 $64,571.70 94,085.00$            

2-19 6 0 $47,015.10 59,840.00$            

3-19 5 0 $126,631.60 172,500.00$          

4-19* 6 0 $132,530.68 168,559.27$          

5-19 5 0 $18,562.50 24,300.00$            

6-19 6 0 $50,010.60 74,860.00$            

7-19 1 0 $36,074.40 41,750.00$            

8-19 4 0 $41,349.60 66,290.60$            

9-19 1 0 $32,039.30 38,495.00$            

10-19 0 0 $471.30 -$                       

11-19 2 0 $8,152.00 12,600.00$            

13-19 2 0 $124,589.50 166,045.00$          

15-19 2 0 $57,740.00 73,440.00$            

16-19 0 0 $14,868.00 -$                       

18-19 6 0 $45,410.00 61,935.50$            

19-19 13 0 $18,913.85 31,177.50$            

20-19 7 0 $29,751.80 46,713.40$            

21-19 3 0 $13,090.00 14,960.00$            

22-19 5 0 $21,671.60 32,930.00$            

23-19 6 0 $180,346.90 231,464.00$          

24-19 2 0 $38,108.70 65,100.00$            

25-19 4 0 $27,788.10 40,894.90$            

Totals 96 0 $1,262,358.03 1,626,100.47$       

*lump sum

28 $1,217,114.63

22 1,626,100.47$       

22 34%

6

96 24,733.82

96 1124

4.4 65.74$                   

1,350.00

61

1,204.52$              

Total Appraised Value of Tracts Sold

Number of Tracts Receiving Bids Total Bid Value of Tracts Sold

Percent Increase Over Appraised Value

Number of Tracts with No Bids

Wiitala & Vozka

Ule Logging

Martin's Forestry

Ule Logging

Tract 

Number

Number of Bids

High Bidder Appraised Value Bid Value

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Weaver Forest Products

Lambert Forest Products

Byers Forestry

Bergman Logging LLC

Bergman Logging LLC

Twin Forest Products LLC

Wiitala & Vozka

Buffalo Lumber & Tie

Theodore Strzok Logging

Tlusty Logging, Inc

Ule Logging

No Bid

Ule Logging

Martin's Forestry

Wiitala & Vozka

No Bid

Twin Forest Products LLC

Pilgrim Brothers Logging

Tlusty Logging, Inc

Tlusty Logging, Inc

Avg. Number of Qualifying Bids Per Tract

Total Number of Qualifying Bids Average Cord Equivalent/Sold Tract

Number of Tracts Offered

Acres Sold

Average Acreage of Sold Tracts

Average $ per Acre Sold 

Number of Tracts with Qualifying Bids

Total Number of Bids Cord Equivalent Volume Sold

Average $ per Cord Equivalent Sold
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