
tons cords per ton per cord per ton per cord per ton per cord

Aspen Pulp 10280 4569 $11.51 $25.89 $15.73 $35.39 $4.40 $9.90

Aspen Bolts 370 164 $15.11 $33.99 $24.00 $54.00 $11.00 $24.75

Oak Pulp 7350 2673 $10.27 $28.23 $16.50 $45.38 $3.50 $9.63

Oak Bolts 2055 747 $24.87 $68.39 $28.00 $77.00 $7.00 $19.25

Mixed Hardwood Pulp 5140 2235 $11.19 $25.74 $20.00 $46.00 $4.20 $9.66

Tamarack 0 0 #DIV/0! #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Basswood Pulp 0 0 #DIV/0! #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Mixed Hardwood Bolts 90 39 $27.00 $62.10 $28.00 $64.40 $25.00 $57.50

Jack Pine Pulp 575 270 $4.40 $9.37 $4.40 $9.37 $4.40 $9.37

Red Pine Pulp 2940 1307 $21.50 $48.38 $21.50 $48.38 $21.50 $48.38

White Pine Pulp 0 0 #DIV/0! #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Red Pine Comingled 10900 4844 $37.40 $84.14 $40.50 $91.13 $20.00 $45.00

White Pine Comingled 4255 2026 $20.59 $43.23 $28.00 $58.80 $8.00 $16.80

Red Oak Sawlog

White Oak Sawlog

Black Oak Sawlog

Red Maple Sawlog

Sugar Maple Sawlog

Mixed Hardwood Sawlog

Red Pine Sawlogs

White Pine Sawlogs

mbfmbf

657 $420.74 $450.00 $270.00

 AVERAGE SUCCESSFUL BIDS – As of November 8, 2018

Clark County Forest

Species/Type
Volume Weighted Average High Low

mbfmbf

185 $406.24 $450.00 $170.00

60 $231.17 $375.00 $120.00

19 $301.84 $375.00 $130.00

0 #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00

20 $375.00 $375.00 $375.00

0 #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00

1 $120.00 $120.00 $120.00



TIMBER SALE BID RESULTS November 8, 2018

CLARK COUNTY FOREST

Qualified Non-Qualified

41-16 0 0 $13,034.60 -$                       

43-16 1 0 $14,649.40 15,660.00$            

55-16 0 0 $11,151.20 -$                       

56-16 1 0 $11,857.20 12,751.00$            

22-17 0 0 $4,084.80 -$                       

23-17 0 0 $1,633.50 -$                       

11-18 2 0 $11,952.40 12,400.00$            

17-18 1 0 $28,290.00 32,323.00$            

18-18 2 0 $27,856.40 34,412.00$            

19-18 3 0 $5,894.80 7,567.00$              

20-18 1 0 $36,760.80 38,290.00$            

21-18 4 0 $20,520.00 25,344.00$            

23-18 0 0 $37,443.40 -$                       

24-18 3 0 $12,126.00 12,990.00$            

25-18 2 0 $44,622.60 63,436.65$            

26-18 0 0 $24,278.00 -$                       

27-18 2 0 $25,585.80 43,742.90$            

28-18 0 0 $62,223.00 -$                       

29-18 5 0 $189,922.65 254,285.00$          

30-18 1 0 $16,167.90 16,184.00$            

31-18 0 0 $94,457.10 -$                       

32-18 6 0 $60,897.60 85,865.00$            

33-18 1 0 $93,085.00 127,565.00$          

34-18 3 0 $77,088.40 107,425.00$          

35-18 3 0 $64,797.40 94,179.90$            

36-18 2 0 $12,298.20 24,403.90$            

37-18 3 0 $65,325.70 91,490.00$            

38-18 4 0 $94,225.00 112,488.00$          

Totals 50 0 $1,162,228.85 1,212,802.35$       

*lump sum

28 $913,923.25

20 1,212,802.35$       

20 33%

8

50 10,744.80

50 537

2.5 112.87$                 

1,256.00

63

965.61$                 

Total Appraised Value of Tracts Sold

Number of Tracts Receiving Bids Total Bid Value of Tracts Sold

Percent Increase Over Appraised Value

Number of Tracts with No Bids

Nicholas Syryczuk

Tlusty Logging, Inc

Tlusty Logging, Inc

Buffalo Lumber & Tie

Tract 

Number

Number of Bids

High Bidder Appraised Value Bid Value

No Bid

Buffalo Lumber & Tie

No Bid

Nicholas Syryczuk

No Bid

No Bid

Yoder Logging

Marth Wood Shaving Supply

Marth Wood Shaving Supply

Bridge Creek Logging

Wiitala & Vozka

Wiitala & Vozka

No Bid

Paul Wojcik

Marth Wood Shaving Supply

No Bid

Tlusty Logging, Inc

No Bid

Bridge Creek Logging

Buffalo Lumber & Tie

No Bid

Nicholas Syryczuk

Buffalo Lumber & Tie

Wiitala & Vozka

Avg. Number of Qualifying Bids Per Tract

Total Number of Qualifying Bids Average Cord Equivalent/Sold Tract

Number of Tracts Offered

Acres Sold

Average Acreage of Sold Tracts

Average $ per Acre Sold 

Number of Tracts with Qualifying Bids

Total Number of Bids Cord Equivalent Volume Sold

Average $ per Cord Equivalent Sold
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